
Amendment 4/14/10 correction of vendor and price on Itm. # 68  
Amendment 4/20/10 correction of vendor and price on Item #70 
Amendment 4/22/10 correction of price on Item #118, Item 6 discontinued by S&S (see revision) 
Amendment 4/30/10 change of price and vendor on item 96 discontinued by S & S (see revision) 

TOWN OF HUNTINGTON 
DEPARTMENT OF AUDIT & CONTROL 

PURCHASING 
100 MAIN STREET 

HUNTINGTON, NEW YORK 11743 
TEL:  (631) 351-3177     FAX:  (631) 351-2833 

 
 
AWARD: ARTS & CRAFTS 09-11-081 

BID OPENED:  11/19/09 
CONTRACT PERIOD:  1/22/10 to and including 12/31/10 
 

AWARDEES: 
 
#12695  Pyramid School Products    Tel: 800-792-2644 
  6510 North 54th Street    Fax: 813-621-7688 
  Tampa, Florida 33610    Email: bids@pyramidsp.com 
 
  #45080  J & A Handy-Crafts, Inc.       Tel:  631-226-2400 
  335 Crooked Hill Road    Fax: 631-226-2564 
  Brentwood, NY 11717    Email: info@jacrafts.com 
 
#64480  S & S Worldwide     Tel:  800-642-7354 
  75 Mill Street     Fax: 800-432-2842 
  Colchester, CT  06415    Email: bids@ssww.com 
 
  #10473/5 School Specialty, Inc.    Tel:  888-388-3224 

W6316 Design Drive    Fax: 888-388-6344 
  Greenville, WI 54942    Email:  Appleton_Bids@ 
         schoolspecialty.com 
 
#8107  Discount School Supply    Tel: 800-836-9515 
  2 Lower  Ragsdale Drive. Ste. 200   Fax: 800-993-3609 
  Monterey, CA 93940    Email: Bids@discount 
         schoolsupply.com 
 
#12060  Commercial Art Supply    Tel: 315-474-1000  
  935 Erie Blvd. East    Fax: 315-474-5311 
  Syracuse, NY 13210    Email: drcohn@commercial 
         artsupply.com 
 
#14084  Standard Stationery Supply Co.   Tel:  800-870-1315 
  2251 Foster Avenue    Fax:  847-1338 
  Wheeling, IL 60090    Email: bids@bestschoolbuys.com 
 
 



09-11-081 

 
ITEM GROUP A - BEADS  

VENDOR 
CAT 

PAGE # 
PRICE 

1 Faceted Beads, 8 mm Plastic Crystal-Look, Multi-Assorted, 
Pkg. of 3000, S&S BE840 

S & S  
Worldwide 

207 $7.70/pkg.

2 Beads, 3 Lb. Bucket of Budget Beads, Variety Of Colors & 
Shapes, B-40xx 

J&A 
Handycrafts 

46 $5.65/ea.

3 Barrel Beads, Multi-Color Plastic Beads, 1/2" Long, 1/2" 
Diameter, Striped 1000 per pack or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

233 $3.15/pkg.

4 Plastic Bead Mix, Assorted Sizes And Shapes, 1 lb pkg,  
Bxx-40 

J&A 
Handycrafts 

46 $2.20/pkg.

5 Large Wood Beads, 90 bead in a lb, BE444 S & S 
Worldwide 

207 $2.60/lb

6 Large Wood Beads In Bright Assorted Colors, 100 
beads/1lb, School Smart 085796 

School 
Specialty 

234 $3.32/lb.

7 Tribeads, Transparent Colored Tribeads, 11mm, 2100 
beads/lb, B-11xx 

J&A 
Handycrafts 

47 $2.90/lb.

8 Pueblo Beads, Large 1/8", Multi-Assortment, 5000 beads/lb, 
Chenille Kraft 245625 or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $2.68/lb.

9 Seed Beads, 1.5 Transparent Barrel Shape Glass Beads, 
20000 beads/pk, S&S RMB BE823 or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

208 $1.84/pk.

10 Standard Fuse Beads, Assorted Colors, 6000/bag, S&S 
BE1221001 

S & S  
Worldwide 

WEB $3.90/bag

11 Monofilament Thread, 100 yd spool, S&S RMB BE628 or 
Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

202 $.69/spool

12 Clay bead Mix, 55 beads/6 oz bag, S&S BE819 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

208 $4.30/bag

13 Beading Needles, NE2820, 6/Pkg. S & S  
Worldwide 

WEB $.44/pkg of  6

14 Extra Thin White Elastic Cord, 30 yd/spool, S&S# RMK-
BE631 or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

202 $.37/spool

15 Earring Backs and Posts, 12/pk S&S# RMF-JE5036 or 
Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

203 $.38/pk

16 Earring with Drop, 6/pk, S&S# RMF-JE9015 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

203 $.35/pk

17 Needle Nose Pliers, Insulated Vinyl Grip, hardened and 
tempered cutting edges, drop forged 4 ½” S&S# RMK-TL74 
or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

203 $2.05/ea

18 Multicolor Sequins pk of 6000, 5mm, S&S# RMGXM494MU 
or Equal  

S & S  
Worldwide 

216 $.84/pk

19 Wire Cutters diagonal cutting, 4 ½” drop forged, lap joint, 
made of alloy steel with ground polished heads, vinyl 
insulated spring action handles. FL337 

S & S  
Worldwide 

179 

$2.19/ea
20 Alpha Beads, Colored Mini-Cubes, pkg of 720, 8mm    

BE1140 
S & S  

Worldwide 
205 $3.10/pkg

21 Fancy Glass Beads, 50 beads/6 oz bag, S& S RMK-BE820 
or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

208 $5.30/bag

22 Large Hole Matte Glass Beads, 25 beads/1/2 lb pkg, S&S 
RMK-BE818 or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide 

208 $4.30/1/2 lb



09-11-081 

ITEM GROUP A – BEADS (cont’d) VENDOR CAT 
PAGE # 

PRICE 

23 Unfinished Wood Beads, Assorted Sizes, pkg of 100, School 
Smart 085801 

School 
Specialty 

234 $1.99/pkg

24 Multi Mini Pony Beads, 1200/bag, S&S RMJ-BE972 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

206 $1.65/bag

25 Jewelry Cord, Assorted Colors, Shiny 1.5mm cord, 14-30ft. 
hanks/pk. JE155 

S & S  
Worldwide 

202 $6.80/pkg

26 Jewelry Cord, black, 1/6” 144 yd. Spool, SP3809BBK S & S  
Worldwide 

202 $4.65/spool

27 Alphabet Beads, white/black, 7mm pkg of 150, School Smart 
085787 

School 
Specialty 

234 
$1.64/pkg

28 Silver Barrel Clasp, Package Of 12, RMK-JE9150 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

203 $.82/pkg.

29 Silver-Lined Glass Beads, Assorted Colors, 4mm, Stanislaus 
Imports 248190, sold by ½ lb prices for 1 lb or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $6.00/lb 
pkg.

30 Small Pegboard Pack, Assorted, 4 Re-usable Pegboards To Use 
With #11, J&A 26000 

J&A 
Handycrafts 

80 $4.00/
pk of 12

31 Spring Rings, 5mm, Nickel Spring Rings, pk of 12, Stanislaus 
Imports 409691 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $1.04/pk.

32 Jump Rings, 7mm, Silver, Stanislaus Imports 409691, 25/bag School 
specialty 

N/A .60/pk

33 Swirl Charms, 6mm-11mm, Assorted Color Metal, pk of 24, J&A 
45467 or Equal 

NO BID  /pk.

34 Shell Disc Beads, Purple Freshwater Shell Disc Beads, 17mm, 
pk of 24, J&A 25653 or Equal 

NO BID  /pk.

35 Safety Pins, ¾”, pk of 25, S&S RMK-GP555B or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

203 $.45/pk.

36 Jewelry Bead Wire, 30 ft of wire, Medium & Heavy-Duty Nylon 
Coated Stainless Steel Wire, 3 spools per set, School Specialty 
443987-705 or Equal   

School 
Specialty 

N/A $6.77/3 
spool set

37 Fuse Beads Easy Pack – Includes 10,000 Beads, 12 Reusable 
Pegboards, Idea Book, 3 Sheets of Ironing Paper, S&S RMK-
BE1205 

S & S  
Worldwide 

213 $6.15/pk.

 GROUP B - CLAY    
38 Extra Pliable Modeling Clay, Air Hardening, BD1307 

 
S & S  

Worldwide 
WEB $21.00/50 

lb. bx
39 Pariscraft, 20 lb. Ctn., (3896693), 5272-0 Pyramid  $28.16/ctn

.
40 Sculpt-it, 2 lb Container, Sargent 407132 or Equal School 

Specialty 
255 $6.39/2 lb.

41 Modeling Tools, Plastic, Set of 7, S&S RMB CP66 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide 

181 $1.05/set 
of 7

42 Model Magic, White, 2lb. Bucket, #4300 Pyramid  $13.04/bkt.

43 Model Magic color set, 2 lb. bucket, #4415 Pyramid  $13.04/bkt.

44 Rubber Brayers – Hard, Scratch Art 406553 or Equal    School 
Specialty 

228 $2.38/ea.
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 GROUP C – CRAYONS & MARKERS    
49 Washable Markers, Broad Tip, 12 to a box, Assorted Colors,  

S&S SC846 
S & S  

Worldwide 
129 $.68/box

50 Watercolor Magic Markers, Set of 10 Assortment Colors In A 
Box, Fine Line, SC472 

S & S  
Worldwide 

131 $.43/set

51 Crayons, Jumbo Non-Roll Crayons, 8 Crayons, 4”, S&S RMK-
SC631 or Equal, Sargent 25-0278 

Standard 
Station 

10 $1.08

52 Crayola Crayons, 16 Crayon Box, SC1BDX   No Substitutions   S & S  
Worldwide 

122 $.98/box

53 Crayola Markers, Non-Toxic, 8 Color Set, Washable, Crayola 
7808 No Substitutions    

Pyramid  $24.00/doz 
box

54 Sharpies, Smearproof, Fine Line, Indelible Marker, Writes On All 
Surfaces, Color: Black, (Sharpie 3001) 

Pyramid  $4.22/doz.

55 Sharpie Permanent Markers, 8 Color Set, Sharpie 30078 
(Sharpie) 

Pyramid  $3.70/set.

 GROUP D – FABRIC, FELT, YARN, ETC….    
56 Burlap, Assorted Colors, 12 Color, Pre Cut Sizes, 12 x18, James 

Thompson 462854                   
School 

Specialty 
N/A $24.47/pkg

.
57 Elastic Cord, 100 Yards Spool, S&S RMK-BE630X or Equal S & S  

Worldwide 
202 $1.90/spoo

l
58 Rug Yarn, 100% Polyester, Machine Washable & Dryable, 60 yd 

Skeins, 12 Different Colors, S&S RMK-YA318 or Equal 
S & S  

Worldwide 
222 $.55/skein

59 Felt Squares, 8 1/2" X 11" or 9" X 12", Assorted Packs of 100 
New Image 362432 

School 
Specialty 

248 $11.21/pkg

60 Embroidery Floss, Various Colors, 105 Skeins, 8 ¾ yd each, 
ST2380 

S & S 
worldwide 

221 $1.90/pkg 
of 24

61 Polyester Felt, 36” wide in 10 Colors, Specify Colors, S&S RMK-
FA3013 or Equal, 1yd pack 

S & S  
Worldwide 

222  $1.52/yd.

 GROUP E - GLUE    
62 Colorsplash White Glue, Gallon, 12 Empty Squeeze Bottles 

w/Caps, One Dispenser Spout, GL419xx 
S & S  

Worldwide 
171 $9.79/set

63 Elmers White School Glue,Gallon, Elm No Substitutions Discount 94 $7.64/gal.
64 Empty Glue Squeeze Bottles, 4 oz. w/Caps, 12 in a set, S&S 

GL3801 or Equal 
S & S  

Worldwide 
172 $3.00/set 

65 White Glue Sticks, Non-Toxic, 30 oz stick, 12 in a pack  
Bondtec ES32 

Standard 
Station 

6 $1.17/pack

ITEM GROUP B – CLAY (cont’d) VENDOR CAT 
PAGE # 

PRICE 

45 Wire Clay Cutter Jack Richeson 1005537  School 
Specialty 

266 .33/ea.

46 Boxwood Modelers, 10-piece set, 6” Jack Richeson 457376 School 
Specialty 

266 $2.66/set.

47 Wooden Rolling Pins,9”, 12/set 6RP Discount 90 $4.24/set.
48 Crayola Air-Dry Clay, 2.5 lb Airdry Bucket, #57-5050 Pyramid  $2.90/2.5 

lb bkt.
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ITEM GROUP E – GLUE (cont’d) VENDOR CAT 
PAGE 

# 

PRICE 

66 Carpenter Wood Glue, formulated for wood, non-toxic, 
water based resin glue. Fast setting, paintable and water 
resistant when dry. 8 oz/ containers, S&S# GL425 . No 
Substitutions. 

S & S  
Worldwide

172 $1.68/cont.

67 Sobo® Glue super strong, non-toxic white glue forms a 
flexible permanent bond on paper, fabrics, strofoam and 
more. Dries clear, 4 oz/bottle. No Substitutions 
(3573573) Sobo 0402 

Pyramid  $1.29/btl

 GROUP F – PAINT & BRUSHES    
68 Crayola, Water Colors, Paint Sets, set of Eight Semi- 

Moist Water Colors with brush in Plastic Box, 3847878 
No Substitutions 

Pyramid 525 $16.20/doz.sets 

69 Tempera Paint, 12 Quarts To Carton, 12 Different Colors, 
Assorted, LTS or Equal 

S & S 
Worldwide 

101 $25.40/ctn.

70 White Bristle Brushes, Pk of 72, 12 ea of Sizes 1, 3, 5 
Round & 2, 4, 6 Flat, Sargent 56-5000 

Pyramid  $6.76/set

71 Easel Brushes, S&S RMB AB 3638/6 or Equal S & S  
Worldwide

 $1.54/6

72 Budget Brushes, Set of 144 Brushes, 24 Each #1 to #6 
Brushes, #2528, AB4000    

S & S  
Worldwide

121 $4.10/set

73 Fingerpaint, 16 oz. Bottles, 12 Assorted Colors, Sargent, 
22-7444 

Pyramid  $12.60/doz.

74 Varnish Brushes, 1" Wide, 1500-1 Commercial
Art 

 $2.86/doz.

75 Camel Hair Line Brush, Set of 5 Sizes, S&S RMK-
AB3635 or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide

120 $1.56/set

76 Student Covered Paint Palette, 7.5” School Smart 
085860 or Equal  

School 
Specialty 

223 $4.49/doz.

77 Sargent No Spill Paint Cups, School Smart 430001 
10/Set or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

222 $3.72/pkg.

78 Acrylic Paint Set, 5 Color Set in ½ oz. Tubes, Non-Toxic, 
Water Thinable & Soluble, S&S RMK-PT129 or Equal 

S & S  
Worldwide

116 $7.35/pk.

79 Acrylic Paints, Non-Toxic, Fast Drying, Permanent All 
Purpose Acrylic Paint I Bright Colors For Use On Fabric, 
Wood, Plastic & More.  Available in easy to Dispense 
Plastic Flip Top Squeeze Bottles, 8 oz bottles, S&S RMK-
PT101B 

S & S  
Worldwide

 
 
 

117 $1.52/each

80 Stubby Brush Canister, Set of 30 Brushes Chenille Kraft 
076182, ½”W x 7” L or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

215 $8.96/pk.

81 Watercolor Cups, 3 ½” Diameter, Pk of 12, 1144211 Pyramid  $.96/doz.
82 5 dz., Plastic Mixing Trays, 3 ½ X 5 ¼ X ¾”, 6 Wells, 

AS533 
S & S  

Worldwide
110 $1.54/doz.

83 Tempera Paint, 16 oz, 12 Bottles/Carton of Individual 
Colors, Choice of Yellow, Brown, Red, Green, Blue, 
White, Black 

School 
Specialty 

204 $12.72/ctn of 12

84 Crayola Arts & Crafts Brushes, Set of 5, Includes Flat 
Brush, Angle Brush & 3 Round Brushes in Different 
Sizes, (3548880) 

Pyramid 3506 $1.75/set
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ITEM GROUP G - PAPER VENDOR CAT 

PAGE # 
PRICE 

85 Construction Paper, 25 Pkgs./Carton, 50 Sheets To Pkg., 
12" X 18", Multi-Colors, 12AS 

Discount 69 $1.61/ctn.

86 Newsprint, 32 Lb., 12"X 18" Ream, 5 Reams/Case, 12NE 
   

Discount 71 $5.06/case

87 Manilla Paper, 50 Lb., 12" X 18", 4 Reams/Case, 12MN Discount 71 $12.11/case
88 Tissue Paper, 50 Sheets, 12" X 18", Assorted Colors, 5 

Each of 10 Colors, #E102, Spectra, 5852 
Pyramid   

$1.66/pkg.
89 22 reams, White Drawing Paper, 12" X 18",  

500 Sheet/Ream, 60 lb. Weight, Sax 053934-705 or Equal 
School 

Specialty 
178 $10.20/ream

90 Fingerpaint Paper, 16" X 22", 60#, 100 Sheets pk, White 
Coated Stock, School Smart 085376 

School 
Specialty 

212 $2.85/pkg.

91 Oaktag, 12" X 18", Manilla, 100 Sheet pkg,  
S&S Worldwide – PE16B 
Pyramid – Pacon, 5134 

S&S 
Worldwide 
Pyramid 

154 

$4.30/pkg
92 Railroad (Poster) Board Coated & Colored On Both Sides, 

22" X 28", 4 Ply Assorted Colors, 25 Sheets/pkg, 
085545030 – Assorted,  

School 
Specialty 

168 $6.24/pkg.

93 Crepe Streamers, Flame Proof, 12 Assorted Colors, 1 ¾” x 
81’, SL265-75 

S & S 
Worldwide 

241 $4.92 pk/12

94 Brown Kraft Paper, 36" X 1000 Ft. Roll, School Smart 
085445  

School 
Specialty 

162 $26.49/roll

95 Colored Cellophane In Assorted Colors, 20” X 150’, Cellset  Discount 79 $11.04/set of  4 

96 Water Color Paper, 9" X 12", Pkg of 100 Sheets, 
Sax#408400 

School 
Specialty 

177 $8.15/pkg.

97 Water Color Paper, 12" X 18", Pkg of 100 Sheets, 285-157-
1218 

Commercial 
Art 

 $15.00/pkg

98 Construction Paper, 50 Sheets/Pkg., 12" X 18", Individual 
Color Pkgs:  Red, Blue, Green, Yellow, Brown, Lt. Blue, 
Orange, Black, White, Pink, Lt. Green 

School 
Specialty 

154 Red             $1.45 
Orange        $1.38 
BrtWt           $1.27 
Blck&Brwn   $1.23 
Lt Green, Pink, 
Sky Blue, Yellow, 
HolGn,Blue  $1.13   

99 Shirt Cardboard, 8 ½" X 11", 50 Sheets/Pack, PE772 S & S  
Worldwide 

154 $4.40/pkg.
of 50

100 Spectra ® Art Tissue™ 20”x30” 24- sheet quires Available in 
Assorted Colors, 10 Sheets Each of 8 Colors, Spectra 5850 

Pyramid  
$1.44/pkg.

101 Tag Board, 9” X 12”, 100 Sheet pkg, Heavyweight, PE116A S & S  
Worldwide 

154 $2.15/pkg.

102 White Tag Board, 12” X 18”, 100 Sheet pkg, Heavyweight, 
School Smart  085497 

School 
Specialty 

167 $4.90/pkg.
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ITEM GROUP H – PENCILS, PASTELS, CHALK, ERASERS VENDOR CAT 

PAGE # 
PRICE 

103 Charcoal Pencils, 12/Pack 
a)  6B Soft, s557-6b 
b)  4B Medium, Pranq 60100 
c)  2B Hard, No. 2 

 
Commercial 

Art 
Pyramid 
Discount 

 
 
 
 

62 
 

 
a) $3.42/doz.  
b) $1.20/doz.  
c) $1.69/doz.  

.
104 Colored Pencils, Non-Toxic, 12/pack, Assorted Colors. 

S&S Worldwide, PT1020 
Pyramid- Dixon, 20270 

S&S 
Worldwide 
Pyramid 

125 
$.58/set.

105 Oil Pastels, 12 Color Set that is long lasting & fade resistant 
for use on Paper, Cardboard Or Canvas, CLI, 90512 

Pyramid  $.55/pkg.

106 White Chalk, Non-Toxic, box of 12 sticks 
School Smart 084832 

School 
Specialty 

30 $.14/pkg.

107 Colored Chalk, Non-Toxic, different colors, box of 12 sticks 
School Smart 084833 

School 
Specialty 

30 $.16/pkg.

108 Kneaded Rubber Erasers, 12/bx , Easy Erase 1222 Standard 
Station 

26 $1.63/bx.

109 Gum Art Erasers, 24/bx, 1144427 Pyramid  $3.24/bx.
110 Pink Pearl Eraser School Smart 077354 or equal 36/pkg School 

Specialty 
6 $1.77/pkg

111 Beginner Drawing Pencil, graphite12/pk, School 
Smart084449 or equal 

School 
Specialty 

3 $1.52/pk.

112 Prang® Drawing Pencils, set of 4 degrees of 
hardness(HB,3B,5B,6B) with color coded barrels. Full-
length, large diameter leads. SAX 442532-705, No 
Substitutions   Prang 02259 

Pyramid   

   $1.27/Set 
of 4

113 Sidewalk Chalk, 52 Assorted Colors in Bucket, BC Discount 66 $1.86/bucket
 GROUP I – SCISSORS    

114 Crayola Scissors for Kids - Stainless Steel Blade, High 
Impact Plastic Handles, Right of Left Hand Use, 5 ½” Long 

a) Blunt Tip, CBS PAK 
b) Pointed Tip, CSSSPAK 

 
 

Discount 

 
 

83 
83 

a)$8.46/doz  
b)$8.46/doz  

.
115 Fiskars Scissors for Big Kids - 6”, Ideal For Kids, Ages 8-12, 

Graduated Edge & Tip With Slightly Larger Handle & Longer 
Blades, Fiskars 075411, No Substitutions 

School 
Specialty 

47 

$21.00/doz
116 "Fiskars" for Kids, 5” Long, For Right or Left Handed 

a)  Pointed, Fiskars 9430, No Substitutions    
b)  Blunt, Fiskars 9416, No Substitutions     

Standard 
Station 

61 
a)$12.93/doz  
b)$12.93/doz

117 Teacher’s Comfort Grip Scissors – 8 ½” Extra Strong, 
Stainless Steel, Cuts Paper, Cardboard, Fabric & Foam, 
Good For Extensive Cutting Projects, Pyramid 1016047 

Pyramid  $7.06/doz.
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ITEM GROUP J – WOOD PIECES VENDOR CAT 

PAGE # 
PRICE 

118 Presswood Bases, 3" X 3", PW3, TT693 S&S 
Worldwide 

187 $7.44/gross

119 Craftsticks, Case of 10,000, CS425   S&S 
Worldwide 

232 $23.50/case

120 Wood Fancies, Assorted Hardwood Turnings, Variety Of 
Shapes And Sizes, 12 lb. Bag, #W-25, J&A or Equal   
    

J&A 
Handycrafts 

107 $20.88/bag

121 Wooden Spools, Various Sizes, 50-100 Bag, Stanislaus 
Imports 1006413 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $2.37/pkg.

122 Scrap Wood Assortment of Various Size Flat Wood Pieces, 
10 lb. Ctn, S&S RMK-WD400 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

232 $4.00/ctn.

 GROUP K – KITS      
123 Heart Bead Necklaces, Assorted Bright Colored Heart 

Beads & Elastic Cord to Complete 12 Necklaces. Love Bead 
Discount 118 $4.92/pkg.

124 Jute Wrap Bracelet Bulk Pack, makes 36/Pack, S&S RMK-
GC620 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

64 $8.75/pkg.

125 a) Jacquard Tie –Die Kit contains pre-measured primary 
colors of procion dye powder in convenient applicator 
bottles, soda ash, dye fixer, rubber bands, rubber gloves, 
directions and an extra bottle to mix your choice of color.   
Makes 15 adult T-shirts. S&S# FA3250 or Equal.  
b) Refill for above Tie-Dye Kit. Assorted Colors, 
S&S#FA3252, FA3253, FA3254 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

 
 
 
 

115 a) $11.15/kit   
 
 
 
 
b) $2.28/ea    

126 Rhythm Band Instrument Set, 15 player set, RBP-15 J&A 
Handycrafts 

91 $32.00/set

127 Early Childhood Rhythm Band Set, S&S HM79 for Pre-K to 
Early Elementary  

S&S 
Worldwide 

245 $29.90/set

128 Precut Eye Masks, S&S RMJ-PE1330 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

142 $1.34/kit

129 Wheely Bugs, Pack of 24, J&A WHB-24 or Equal J&A 
Handycrafts 

 $10.40/kit

130 Metallic Bead Critters, Key Rings, Pack of 50 GP1319, 
Beaded Bugs or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

66 $4.30/kit

131 Tropical Aquarium, 11” X 9”, Pack of 12, S&S RMK-CE4357 
or Equal   

S&S 
Worldwide 

90 $6.90/kit

132 Tie Dye Classroom Pack, Rupert Gibbon 244917 School 
Specialty 

253 $11.02/pack

133 Tulip Ultimate One-Step Tie-Dye Kit, Duncan 411162 School 
Specialty 

N/A $9.28/pack

134 Jacquard Dye-Na-Flow Classroom Pack includes all 
supplies needed to do hundreds of fabric painting projects, 
Triarco #RA0593 or Equal 

NO BID  /pk

135 Color Me Fantasy Masks – ready to decorate masks, Pk of 
25, S&S RMK-CO117 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

23 $1.75/pk.
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ITEM GROUP L – MUSIC  VENDOR CAT 

PAGE # 
PRICE 

136 CD & K Karaoke System  S&S EMG-16500 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

WEB $93.00/ea

137 Portable AM/FM CD Recorder S&S EMG-16085 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

WEB $48.00/ea

138 Aerobic Club for Kids S&S EMG-MM94 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

245 $11.50/ea

139 Children of the World CD S&S EMG-mm95 or Equal NO BID  /ea
140 Raffi CDs, Singsong Discount  $12.74/ea
141 Sight World Readers Collection II S&S EMG-BK1578 or 

Equal 
S&S 

Worldwide 
WEB $23.80/ea

 GROUP M – MISCELLANEOUS     
142 Lanyard Spools, Case of 50, 100 Yard Spools, 10 Popular 

Colors, LA462 
S&S 

Worldwide 
201 $46.00/case

143 Lanyard Hooks, Nickel Plated Metal, 7/8" Long, #LS-10, 
LAX201X  

S&S 
Worldwide 

202 $1.00/gross

144 Craft Button Assortment, All Sizes & Styles, 1 lb Tub, 
BE9800 

S&S 
Worldwide 

WEB $1.92/tub

145 Tiles, 10 lb Bag, S&S RMK-TT650XB or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

187 $31.00/bag

146 Craft Straws, 17" Straws, 1800 pkg., Chenille Kraft 200216 School 
Specialty 

258 $23.76/pkg

147 Glitter, Set, Assorted Colors, 12 ¾ oz jars, Pyramid 43-3xx Pyramid  $2.88/doz.
148 Pipe Cleaners, Chenille 12", Pkg. of 100, #C-2, Pyramid 

1218841 
Pyramid  $.59/pkg.

149 Quill Feathers, Assorted Colors, 12” Long, Set of 24, 
BE2865 

S&S 
Worldwide 

215 $6.95/pkg.

150 Fluff Feathers, 200 per Bag #BE-1207 or Equal 
 

S&S 
Worldwide 

215 $.41/bag

151 Spring Clothespins, 3 ¼”, Strong, 50 pack, Sax 085965-705 
or Equal  Item No. changed Chenille Kraft 1006317 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $1.37/pkg.

152 Flat Clothespins, 3 ¾”, Pack of 40, School Smart 085964 School 
Specialty 

244 $1.74/pkg.

153 Plastic Looms w/ Hook & Instructions, Wood Novelty 
224466 or Equal 

School 
Specialty 

252 $15.60/doz.

154 Cotton Loopers, 10 oz bag, Wood Novelty 433511 or Equal School 
Specialty 

252 $3.44/case

155 Balloons, 9" Round, GA36 S&S 
Worldwide 

WEB $4.80/gross

156 Masking Tape, 3/4" Width, 60 Yards Roll, Shurtape, P106B Pyramid  $.63/roll
157 Stapler, Full Strip Size, Standards 220 Standard 

Station 
67  $1.49/ea.

158 Styro Foam Balls, 3", Pk of 12, SY621 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

198 $1.75/doz.

159 Styro Foam Balls, 2" Pk of 12, SY641 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

198 $1.00/doz.
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160 Wiggly Eyes, 4 mm (3/6") Plastic, Pk of 100, S&S RMK-
TR251 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

217 $.20pk

161 Wiggly Eyes, 7 mm (1/4”) Plastic, Pk of 100, S&S RMK-
TR252 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

217 $.24pk

162 Wiggly Eyes, 10 mm (3/8") Plastic, Pk of 100, S&S RMK-
TR253 or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

217 $.32pk.

163 Pom Pom's, Multi-Color Assortment 1/2" (100/Pk),  
S&S RMK-YA22B or Equal 
School Specialty – School Smart 085923 

S&S 
Worldwide 

School 
Specialty 

214 
 

230 

$.51/pkg.

164 Pom Pom's, Multi-Color Assortment 1" (100/Pk), S&S RMK-
YA22C or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

214 $.98/pkg.

165 Pom Pom's, Multi-Color Assortment 2" (50/Pk), S&S RMK-
YA22D or Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

214 $2.25/pkg.

166 Sculpture Wire, 14 gauge, 350 ft. Spool, Twist Discount 122 $7.64/spool
167 Pin Backs, Nickel Pin Backs, Pk of 144 

 A)    3/4 inch – JE5035B 
 B)    1 inch – JE5035C 

S&S 
Worldwide 

 
203 

 
a) $5.52/pkg  
b) $6.72/pkg  

168 Craft Wire 6/25yd Spools per pack, Colored, BE807 S&S 
Worldwide 

202 $11.45/pkg

169 Trinket Box- Wood, Metal Hinges & Latch, 4 3/8” x 1 5/8” x 3 
½” WD20 

S&S 
Worldwide 

WEB $14.40/doz

170 Twisteez Soft Wire, Colorful Plastic Covered Copper Wire 
for Beading, Jewelry, Pk of 200, Twist 

Discount 122 $7.64/ea

171 Paper Fasteners Metal Shank ¾”, 100/bx, Pyramid 3RBP Pyramid  $.39/bx
172 Key Ring w/Chain S&S# JE8022 or Equal S&S 

Worldwide 
203 $2.67/pk/12

173 Welcoming Name Tags, 100/Box, (1029750), Maco Hello Pyramid  $1.80/pkg
174 Magnetic Strips Roll, ½” Wide, 100’ Roll, S&S RMJ-AS609 

or Equal 
S&S 

Worldwide 
174 $9.45/roll

175 Square Frames, S&S RMJ-MT101 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

146 $1.32/pk of 
12

176 Small Square Frames, S & S RMJ-MT5 or Equal S&S 
Worldwide 

233 $.46/pk of 12

177 Craft Foam Sheets, Value Pack, Biggy, 100 per pack Discount 111 $8.49/pack
178 Craft Foam Sheets, 9X12, Pk of 6, Individual Colors S&S 

RMJ-AC902 001-012 or Equal 
S&S 

Worldwide 
194 $.68/pack

179 Natural Fiber Cord, Assorted Colors S&S RMJ-JE129 or 
Equal 

S&S 
Worldwide 

202 $1.98/roll

180 Colored Macaroni, 1 lb pkg, TR13 S&S 
Worldwide 

218 $3.95/pkg

181 Armature Wire, 1/16” Diameter, 50 ft Roll, Arcor Elect. 
411375 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $2.46/spool

182 Armature Wire 1/8” Diameter, 50 ft Roll, Arcor Elect. 411374 School 
Specialty 

N/A $8.29/spool
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183 Light Gauge Art Wire, 12 gauge, 34 ft Roll, 1 LB, Arcor 
Elect. 463802 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $4.02/spool

184 Dark Annealed Stove Pipe Wire 14 gauge, 58 ft Roll, Arcor 
Elect. 238104 

School 
Specialty 

N/A $3.77/1lb coil

185 Spray Painting Bottles – 16 oz, Pk of 6, S&S RMK-AC740 or 
Equal 

NO BID  /pk.

 
In accordance with General Municipal Law, Article 5-G Paragraph 119-o an inter-
municipal agreement has been entered into between the Town of Huntington and 
the Incorporated Villages within the Town of Huntington, the West Babylon 
UFSD, the Huntington School UFSD, the South Huntington UFSD, the Elwood 
UFSD, the Northport-East Northport School District UFSD, the Half Hollow Hills 
CSD, the South Huntington Water District and the Greenlawn Water District.  
This agreement permits the aforesaid villages and districts to purchase goods 
and services from this bid, as awarded, at the same as the Town of Huntington.  
Said villages and districts will issue purchase contracts for their requirements and 
will be solely responsible for payment of all claims made thereupon. 


